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+ Maker Space Tables
+ Shape Tables
+ Discover Seating
+ Alphabet Seating

PRODUCTS



Large, highly-visible, 
collaborative makerspaces 
line the heart, or the 
arroyo, of the building, 
fostering student 
awareness of their peers’ 
work. Common student 
areas and circulation paths 
are crafted to allow for 
some separation between 
elementary and middle 
school students, while 
maintaining connectivity 
and a sense of communit.

The design is a 
celebration of student-
driven learning and 
making. Kindergarten 
through fifth grade 
students are introduced 
to C-STEM subject matter 
in a practical manner 
using experimentation, 
while sixth through eighth 
grade students have 
the opportunity to focus 
deeper on concepts that 
pique their interest. 

Size: 98,000 SF
Number of students: 773
New construction
Middle School
Elementary
CTE/STEM/VPA/STEAM
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